Date: March 28, 2005

From:Margaret Ho Huey
3660 Taraval St. Apt 4
San Francisco, CA 94116

To: San Mateo County Board of Supervisors
400 County Center
Redwood City, CA 94063

Re: APNs 006-205-080 & 006-206-090 Refund

To Whom It May Concern:

I, Margaret Ho Huey, purchased two vacant lots in Daly City on September 23, 1999:
parcel numbers 006-206-080 & 006-206-090 (Deed # 1999-163255)

The Assessor’s Office incorrectly put the full-assessed value of $196,000 on parcel 006-
206-080. In all the time that I have owned the property, I have paid all the bills
received on this parcel in a timely manner. Since I was paying on the assessed value
based on my purchase price, I always assumed that I was paying for both parcels in the
one bill T received each year. When I did notice the error in July of 2004, I immediately
notified the Assessor’s Office and was assured that it was their mistake and they would
correct the matter by splitting the value for both parcels.

I thought the matter had been taken care of until I received a "Notice of Power to Sell
Tax Defaulted Property” from the Tax Collectors’ Office dated February 18, 2005.
Unfortunately the purchase date was not within the 4 year Statute of Limitations, and I
was charged for the 1999-2000 and 2000-2001 bills on parcel 006-206-090 based on
the old owner's value plus penalty charges in the amount of $3,889.63. I have already
paid, based on my full value, for these two years as billed on parcel 006-206-080.

Since I have paid everything I owe on these properties and this is clearly the Assessor’s
mistake, I am asking to be refunded the $3,889.63, a bill that should never have been
mine.

Thank you for your consideration in this matter.

Sincerely,

Margare Huey
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April 2, 2005

From: Margaret Ho Huey
3660 Taraval St., Apt. # 4
San Francisco, CA 94116

To:  San Mateo County Board of Supervisors
400 County Center
Redwood City, CA 94063

To San Mateo County Board of Supervisors,

I immigrated to the U.S.A. in November 1951. T have been in this country more than half
a century, 54 years. During this time I bought and sold about 10 properties. I-aiways paid
off all loans and taxes. Within these 54 years I never owed one penny. You may check
up on this, if you wish. My tax I.D. number 1s: 552-44-8008.

1 don’t know what happened 1n this recent situation. It seems there was an error
somewhere. Approximately the same time I bought both lots number 25 and number 26,
which had the one oid house on it. The house is demolished now. There is only one tax
sheet statement for lots number 25 and 26. For iot # 27, there 1s one separate tax
statement. Ireceived only one sheet for iots 28 and 29. In total I received three tax
statements; and I paid all these on time without fail. Unfortunately, I didn’t receive the
tax statement you talked about. If I didn’t get this in the mail, how would I know how
much I have to pay? I always thought lots 28 and 29 were just like lots 25 and 26, which
were on one statement. '

I have worked several years as an employee and later on as a proprietor of my own
restaurant and small apartment since 1953 to 1996. 1worked very hard, every day 12
hours to 15 hours 7 days a week to be able to support myseif and have a decent and honest
living. At that time I was stili young and I felt healithy enough to work hard. Now
sometimes I think about all the years I devoted to my work in the past and tears drop from
my eyes.

Right now I’m stili working part time and continue to pay taxes. I just don’t know how to
quit working. All these 54 years I have been invoived in the restaurant business and
owned properties. Over the 54 years that I have worked in total I probably aiready paid
about one million doilars in taxes. Since I paid so much aiready, why shouid I deceive
anyone by not acknowledging this one statement? Please heip me straighten up this error.
1 appreciate your cooperation. Thank you very much.

Sincerely yours,

Margaret Ho Huey
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| YARNELL & BON

Consulting Civil Engineers gnd Land Surveyors
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November 13, 1972

Ms. Margaret Ho Huey
3660 Taraval

San Francisco, Ca. 94116

INVOICE
the request of Ed Wong.

Joseph N. Yarnell, C.E
Martin M. Ron, L.S.

Invoice #102
Job #802

for professional sesrvices rendered through November 13, 1972 in accordance with

Survey on 90th Street in Daly City.

Total due

$300,00

804 MISSION STREET, PENTHOUSE » SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94105 - (415) 433-0183 & 392-1720



T . ) EDWARD WONG & ASSOCIATES
: ARCHITECTS

93 Amber Drive
San Francisco, Ca. 94131

October 5, 1973

Miss Margaret Ho Huey
3660 Taraval Street
San Francisco, California

Subject: Architectural Fee
Tea Tree Restaurant
Daly City, California

Dear Margaret,

| am submitting my billing for services as follows:

Basic Fee:
7% Of $ ]56,""58-00 ..-..-eoou..on.oto.---.o..$ ]0’950.00

Now due for completion of Working Drawings and
Specifications per our Agreement dated September 30,

1972:
65% OF § 105950.00 vevevensoasensorosaessnsas$ 75118.00

CVé“? truly yours,

/gé'rd Wong

Architect

ew:me



PRELIMINARY NOTICE s cose-s

AS REQUIRED BY CALIFORNIA LAW (Sections 1190.1 and 1193 of Code of Civil Procedure and Section 4210 of the Government Code
FURNISHING LABOR, SERVICE, EQUIPMENT OR MATERIALS. THE LAW PROVIDES THAT IF BILLS ARE NOT PAID IN FULL
SUCH LABOR, SERVICE, EQUIPMENT OR MATERIALS, THE IMPROVED PROPERTY MAY BE SUBJECT TO MECHANICS’ LIENS.

) OF
FOR

TO: OWNER, REPUTED OWNER OR PUBLIC AGENCY:

8 ng Avenue

3. H AU wi-Ne gl & 1)
{Address of person or firm furnish

ing labor, service, equipment or materials) .

has furnished labor, service, equipment or materials of the following general description:

{Address of jobsite)

The name of the person who contracted for the purchase of such labor, service, equipment or materials is

Dated] .S
Date notice is mailel)

’ ol - I At + '-
e of person or firm fiifnishing laBor,

service, equipment or materials)

(Nam

(Signature)

This copy for

OWNER



